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Rincon Science reporter, BBC News Infants are born with
10,000 trillion microbes Scientists have shown that the early-

life environment of premature infants "programmes" the
composition of the human gut. The ability to digest lactose and
milk sugar is learnt and "picked up" by adults in their 20s and
30s, after which they are permanently "hard wired" into the

gut. Researchers from the University of California conducted a
study of 10,000 baby gut microbiomes. The team tracked the
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composition of the infants' guts over time. Its results,
published in the journal Scientific Reports, show that the

mixture of bacteria in a "gut microbiome" is so variable at birth
that it resembles the adult gut microbiome in every way. "It
was a bit surprising in the beginning," says Patrick Schloss,

who co-led the study. "We found that the same holds true after
one year of age. "Already, by a year of age, there are major
differences between the microbiomes of infants that were
breast-fed versus those that were formula-fed," says Dr

Schloss. Professor Stefan Schinkinger, also from the University
of California, says that this is the first comprehensive analysis

of early-life influences on the composition of an individual's
microbiome. "Since the human gut is thought to be a window
on the rest of the human body, this is really interesting and
should lead to a better understanding of human health," he
told BBC News. Bacterial build-up In the next few years the
team will also be able to identify babies who are at risk of
developing allergies or obesity. "The study of our day-old

infants showed that a substantial amount of variation between
babies is determined at birth," explains
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